
CITY OF LYNNWOOD 
ORDINANCE NO. 2216 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDI NG CHAPTER 16.04 OF THE 
LYNNWOOD MUNlCIPAL CODE Al\'D ADDING NEW SECTIONS 
THl~RETO; PROVIDING FOR THE PROTECTION OF PUBLIC 
HEALTH, WELFARE AND SAFETY BY ADOPTING A NEW 
UNIFOR.t\11 BVILDJNG CODE R.EG ULATING THE ER ECTION, 
CONSTRUCTION, ENLAROEM!:NT, ALTERATION, REPAIR, 
MOVING, REMOVAL, CONVERSION, DEMOLITION, 
RELOCATION, OCCUPAl"fCY, EQUIPM ENT, USE, HE IGHT, AREA, 
AND MAINTENANCE OF BUILDu'lGS 0.R STRUCTURES TN THE 
CITY OF LYNNWOOD; PROVIDING FOR Tiffi ISSUANCB OF 
PERl'vUTS AND COLLECTION OF FEES TlfEREfo"OR; PROVIDING 
PE ALTIES FOR VIOLATION OF THE CODE. 

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF LYNNWOOD DO ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS: 

Section J. I.MC 16.04,0]Q Amended, Section 16.04.010 of ihe Lyunwood Municipal 
Code (hcrcinarrer rclcrred to as "LMC) is amended lo read as follows: 

ADOPTION OF l JNlFORM CODE 
As :m1e11dcd by the provisions of this Chapter and the Stale of Washin1,rton 
Build.ing Code. the Unifomt Building Code. -µ}94-1997 Editiou (Volumes I. 2 and 
3) by ihe International Conference of Building Officials. together with Appendix 
Clrn1>tcrs 15, 29 and 33, one copy of which, along with the Stale of Washington 
building Code Cmu,cil 's amendments, shall be on file in the office of" the 
Lynnwood City Finance Director, arc adopted by this re ference. 

Section 2. LMC 16.04.015 ,\mended. The lollowing arc re-adopted as part or the 
Lynnwood Municipal Code: 

16.04.015. DEflNITJQNS 
A. 2ll -.l , (ffiC Amended. Section 2 11 - :f .! of tl1e edition of the Unifonn 

Building Code adopted by this Chapter. enti tled ··Jurisdiction", is amended 
by delet ing there from the definition ·'Jurisdiction·• in 21 1-J thereo f" and 
inserting in its place the fo llowing: 

lyn\or<l\9091:ionl,00I 

Whenever the 1en11 '"jurisdicti on" or "'C ity"' is used herein. it shall 
mean the City or Lynnwood. 'vVhencvcr the term ' 'Code" used 
herein , il shall mean die edition of the Unifom, Bui lding Code as 
adopted by Chapter 16.04 LMC anti U1c provisions of Chapter 
16.04 LMC. 



B. 207-f. l /BC Amended. Subsection 207-F of the edition of the Uniforn, 
Building Code adopted by this chapter, de fining "Fire Code," is amended 
to read as follows: 

FIR_E CODE is the edition of the Unifonn Fire Code promulgated 
by the Intenmtional Fire Code Institute, as adopted by this 
jurisdiction, ,rnd the provisions of Ch. 9.04 LMC. 

C. Whenever the tcnn "Code" is used iu this Chapter, it shall mean include 
Lhc provisions of this Chapter and the edition of the Uniform Building 
Code a:; adopted by this Chapter. Whc•ever the tenn "City" or 
' j urisdiction'' is used in this Chapter, it shall mean the City of Lynnwood. 

Scc(ion 3. LMC 16.04.020 and Scclion 101,2 lJBC Anwndcd. LMC 16.04.020 and 
Section 101.2 of the edition of the Uniform Building Code as adopted by this Chapter are 
re-adopted as iollows: 

JO 1.2 PURPOSE AND INTENT 

Jt is expressly the purpose o f this Code 10 provide for and promote the health, 
safely and welfare o f the general public and not to create or otherwise establish or 
designate any particular class or group of persons who will or should be especially 
protected or benefited by the 1cm1s of this Code. 

It is the specific intent of this Code thnt nt1 provision or tenn used in thi s Code is 
intended to impose any duty whatsoever upon lhe City of' any of its officers or 
employees for whom the implementation or enforcement of this Code shall be 
discretionary and not manda101y. 

Nothing contained in this Code is intcudcd to be nor shall be construed 10 create 
or fom1 the basis o f any liability on the part of the City, or its officers, employees 
or agents for any injury or damage resulting from the lai lurc of a building to 
comply witb the provisions of this Code, or by renson or in consequence of any 
i11spce1ion, notice, order, ccrtilicate, pcrmission or approval, authorized or issued 
or done in connection with the irnplemcnrntion or enforcement of this Code, or by 
reason of any action or 'inaction on the part of llw City rcl,1tcd in any manner to 
the enforcement oft his Code by its of'ficcrs, employees or agents. 

Sec.Hon 4, LMC 16.04,0J0 and Section 104.2 UBC Amended, LMC 16.04.030 and 
Section 104.2 of tbe edi tion of the Unifo11n Buildi ng Code adopted by this Chapter arc 
re-adopted ,1s follows: 

ly11\011.h9098ord.OO I 2 



SlJBSECTJON )04.2.1 POWERS AND DUTIES OF Blffi, DJNG OFFICIAL 

I 04.2.1 General. The Building Official is hereby uulhorizcd lo enforce all the 
provisions of this Code. For such purpose. he shall have the powers of' a police 
officer. For Ille purpose of administering and enforci ng Appendix Chapter 33 of 
this Code. the Director of Public Works is appointed and designated as the 
Building Official with respecl lo all matters contained within said Appendix 
Chapter 33. 

T he Building Official shall have the power to render interpretations of tbis Code 
and to adopt and enforce rules and regulations sup1>lemcntal to this Code as he 
may deem necessary in order 10 elari ly lhe application of the provisions of this 
Code. Such interpretations, mies and regulations shall be in conformity with the 
intent and purpose of this Code. 

Section 5. LMC 16.04.040 and SccHon 104.2 UBC Amended. LMC 16.04.040 and 
Section l 04 of the edition of the Uni form Building Code adopted by this Chapter arc re
adopted as follows: 

104.2. 11 Violations & Penallies: Any person, fi rm or corporation violatlng any of 
the provisions of this Code shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, and each such 
person, fi rm, or corporation shall be guilty of a sep11rate ollcnse for each and 
every day, or portion thereof; during which any violation of any of the provisio11s 
of this Code is committed, continue. or pcm1itted. 

Anyone concerned in the violation or failure to comply witb !110 provisions of this 
Code, whether directly committ ing the act (lr effecting the omissions constituting 
the offense, or aiding or abetting the same, whether present or absent; and anyone 
who directly or indi rectly counsels. encourages, hi res, commends, induces or 
otherwise procures ;mother to violate or foil to comply with the provisions of this 
Code, is and shall be guilty of .i misdemeanor. 

Upon conviction of any such misdemeanor, such person, fi rm, or corporation shall 
be punishable by a fine of not more than S 1,000.00 or by imprisonment for not 
more than 90 days, or by both such fine and imprisonment. 

Section 6. LMC 16.04.050 and s ection JOJ 1mc Amrnded. LMC 16.04.050 and 
Section 103 of tbc edition of the Uniform Building Code adopted by this Chapter arc re
adopted as follows: 

It shall be unlawful for any person to remove, muti late, destroy or conceal any 
lawful notice issued or posted by the Building Officiu l pursuont to the provisions 
of this Code. 

3 



Section 7. LMC 16.04.060 and Section 106 UBC Amended. LMC 16.04.060 and 
Section 106 of the edition of the Unifonn Building Code adopted by this Chapter arc re
adopted as follows: 

I 06. 1 Pcrmils Required. Except as specified in subsection (b) o f this section, no 
bui lding or structure regulated by Lhis Code shall be erected, constructed, 
enlarged, altered, repai red, moved. improved, removed, eonverlcd, or demolished 
without first obtaining from the Building Oflieial a separate permit for each 
bui lding or structure. unless the work doe.s not exceed one hundred dollars. 

I 06.2 Exempted \Vork. A building permit shall not be required for the 
following: 

1. One-story detached accessory bui !dings used as tool and storage 
sheds and s imilar uses, provided Lhe protected roof' area docs not 
exceed 64 square feet. 

2. One"story playhouses not exceeding 48 square feet of projccled 
roof an:a. 

3. Fences not over three feet high. 
4. Movable cases, counters and partitions not over five feet 9 inches 

high. 
5. Retaining waUs which are 1101 over four feet in height measured 

from the boitom or the footing to the top of the wall unless 
supponing a surchnrgc or impounding Class J, U or 111-A liquids. 

6. Water lanks supported direclly upon grade if the capacity docs not 
exceed 5000 gallons and ihc ratio of height to diameter or width 
does not exceed two to one. 

7. Platfonns, walks and driveways not more than 12 inches above 
grade and not over any basement or story below. 

8. Painting. papering and similar finish work. 
9. Temporary motion picture, television and theater stage sets and 

scenery. 
10. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall of Group R, 

Division 3, and Group U occupancies when projecting not more 
than 54 inches. 

11. Prefabricaled swimming pools accessory to a Grou1> R, Divis ion 3 
Occupancy in which the pool walls are entirely above the adjacent 
grade and if the capacity docs not exceed 5,000 gallons. 

Unless otherwise exempted by this Code, separate plumbing. e lectrical and 
mechanical pemtits shall be requi red for the above exempted items. 

Excrn1>tion from the permit requirements of Ibis Codi; shaU t1ot he dec1J1cd to 
grant authorization for any work to be done in any manner in violation of the 
provisions of this Code or any other laws ofu1is juriscliclion. 

l)nlord\90'J8ard 001 4 



Section II. LMC 16,04.065 8cpcnlcd. LMC 16.04.065, which reads 

¼~ubseetielhl03(a) UBG-A!11en<lffi 

:i:lc1e-Htt~le iHg Ofiioial-rnEl)'-fSSU- t-fleFm•iHe-¼Heve OF remave a bu+laiF1g enly if Hie 
saui¼ary se•,•,•eF is-e-awed-aHll~oe~me-jffieF-l~ ss-. 

is repealed in its entirely. 

Seclion 9, LMC (6,04,070 URC Scctjon !06.3 UBC Amended. LMC 16.04.070 & 
Section 106.3 of the addi tion of the Uni fonn Building Code adopted by this Chapter are 
re-adopted as follows: 

Subsection 106.3 of the ..:dition of the Uni form Building Code adopted by this 
Chapter, entitl ed "Application" is amended as follows: 

Section I 06.3.1 Appl ication. To obtain a permit, the upplicant shall fi rst fi le an 
application therefor in writing on a fom1 lilrnishcd by the City of Lynnwood's Building 
Official for that purpose. Every such applicnLion shall: 

1. ldenti (y and describe the work to he covered by the pem1it for which 
application is made. 

2. Describe the land on which the proposed work is 10 be done by legal 
description and/or parcel nurnber(s). Su·ecl address or similar description, if 
available, shall be provided to readily identify and defini tely locate the proposed 
building or work; 

3. l.ndicatc the proposed use or occupancy for which 1he application is 
intended; 

4. Be accompanied by plans, diagrams, computations, specifications and 
other data as required by Subsection I 06.3.2 UBC, which also meet the applicable 
requirements of LMC 16.04.075. 

5. Slate the valuation of any new building or strncturc or any addition, 
remodeling or a.Iteration to an existing building, in accordance with the provisions 
ofLMC 16.04.105. 

6. Provide such infom1ation and evidence as is required by current State 
law to be fumisl1cd in connection with an application for a building pcm1it or as a 
prcreqttisitc to 1he issuance of a building permi t. 

7. Provide such other data nnd info1111ation as may be required by the 
Building Official. 

8. Be signed by the applican1, or the applicant's authorized agent. 
(Ord. 19 14ssl. 1992: Ord. 1894 ss9, 1992: Ord. 138L ss7. 1983) 
16.04.071* FULLY CONJPLETE BUILDING PERMIT APPLICATION 
DEFINED 

A. To constitute a fully complete appl ication for a bui lding pennil , such 
application shall: 

lyn,ml\90noro.OOI 5 



I. Comply with all provisions of Subsection I 06.3.1 of the ed ition of Lhe 
Uniform Building Code as adopted and amended by this j urisdiction; and 

2. If the applicant is a contractor required LO be registered under Chapter 
18.27 RCW, as now existing or hereafter amended, said contractor shall have 
been so registered at Lhe time he submitted his application to the City's Building 
Official; and 

3. The applicnnt shall have paid any industrial insurnnee premiums if 
rcqui(ed to do so by the State's Department of L:1bor and Industries at the time he 
submits his application Lo the Building Official or the applicant shall have been 
c1ualified as a self-insurer. 

B. In add ition to fu lfilling the requirements of Subsection A, to constitute a fully 
complete application for a building pem1it, the applicant shall also pay, at ihe time 
of application, any and all City fees that arc required to be paid ai the ti.me that the 
appl ication is submillccl. 

Section !O. LMC 16.04.075 & URC Sccrion 3.2 UBC Amended. LMC 16.04.075 & 
Section I 06.3.2 arc amended hy adding a new paragraph as follows: 

:Ui (l'I 2 106.3 ? _ SJGNEP DATED STAMPED DRAVvINGS REQUIR ED 
All applications for bui lding pcnnits shall be nccompanicd by construction 
drawings signed, dated, and scaled or stamped 0 11 each individual page by a 
registered architect or professional engineer in accordance with Chapters 18.08 or 
t 8.43 RCW, as now existing or hcrcafier amended, revised. recodi tied, or 
reenacted. unless exempted by RCW 18.08.410 or RCW 18.43.1 30(1 )-(8), (9), as 
now existing or hereafter umendcd, revised. rccodilicd, or re-enacted. 
Applications lhat do not comply with this section shall not be accepted or 
processed by the Building Official. 

Se#iftu-11. I.MC Jj .114.118~ --MG-I 6.Q4.080 l!lJEI-Grd¼Aonee-No. 1533 are-clelelee--in 
tlleir eHlirely. [previously deleted] 

Section l2. LMC 16.04.090 1111d Subsection 109.1 UBC Ame111lt~d. LMC 16.04.090 
and Subsection t 09.1 o f the edition o f the Uniform Building Code adopted by this 
Chapter arc re-adopted as follows: 

IQ9.l USE AND OCCCTPANCY 
EXCEPTION: Group U Occupancies 

Section n. LMC J6.04.095 :md Subsection 106.4.1 lIBC Amended. LMC 16.04.095 
and Subsection t 06.4.1 o f the edition of the U11 i form BLLilding Code adopted by thi s 
Chapter arc re-adopted as follows: 

106.4.J flor a build ing being moved or removed, two thousand (S2,000) dollars 
cash security will be required to the effect that the site from which the building is 
being moved or removed has been cleared o f all debris, concrete foundation, etc., 

6 



and Jell in a tidy condition; provided, however, that the Building Official may 
waive s,1 id security deposit if, for the property, there is in force and effect an 
active bui lding pcm1it or an active fill nnd grading permit for which the applicable 
bonds have been posted. Waiver of the security deposit does nOI constitute waiver 
of the duty to restore the site ns herein provided. Restoration of the site must be 
accomplished within thirty (30) days fi·om the date of issuance of the permit. Tbe 
sanitary sewer is required to be capped at the property line prior to issuance of the 
permit to move or remove the bui lding from any site in the City of Lynnwood. 

Section 14. LMC 16.04.IQQ & Tnl>lc 1-A of Oie addition of the t /njform Buihling 
Code adopted bv this Chapter are amended by Addition of the FoUowjng: 

Other Inspections and Fees: 

(i. 

7. 

8. 

9, 

Fee for processing and issuing a pemtil for which no plan 
review fee is chargcd ................................. ............................. Aeli1R-l-ees1s $ 15.00 
Plan review fees for stock basic single family residential 
plans where there are no changes to the plnn whatsoever 
shall be .................... .. ................................ ............ ..... .. .......... S 11 Q.00 SI I 5.00 
Plan review fees for duplicate multi-family buildings on 
a specific project shall be a completepl:m review fee for the 
first structure and $-5MO $65.00 per individuaJ dwell ing unit 
thereaficr. 
This is applicable where there ure no changes io subsequent 
buildings whatsoever. This docs not apply to phased projects. 
Cost to set up basic plan shall he the full tlljll) check fee. 

Section )5. LMC J6,04,105 and UBC Section )07.2 Amended, LMC 16.04.105 is 
amended by addition of the following: 

J6,Q4 ,195 ValuQl-itrn afConurnetieft )07.2 PERMIT FEES. 
The Building Official shall establish the valuation of constrnction projects for 
which fees as speci licd m1der Table 1-A arc assessed. 

Said valuation shall be detem1incd by using the most current "Building Valuation 
Data•·. excluding the regional modifiers. as published in "Building Standards" by 
the International Conference of Bui lding Officials, a copy of whicb shall be kept 
on file in the office of the Lynnwood City Finance Director. and which is 
incorporated herein by this reference. 

Valual ions for tenant improvement and interior remodel construction shall be 
detennincd by the following formula: 

7 



Square footage of area or work MULTIPLIED BY 30% of the cost per 
square foot for new construction EQUALS the co11s1rnctio11 valuation for 
which fees from Table I -A will be assessed, 

Section Hi. LMC 16.04,1 JO and SccJion 2](1-0 UBC Amended. LMC 16.04.110 and 
Section 216-0 of the edition of the Uniform Build ing Code adopted by this Chapter arc 
re-adopted as follows: 

OCCUPANCY is the purpose for which a Building, or part thereof. is used or 
intended to be used. Occupancy includes the installation of shelving, fumiturc, 
tixt11rcs and app liances unless such items arc included in a building pem1il. 
Occupancy also includes stocking or shelves, storage of fumirure or material for 
sule, interviewing personnel or use-for manage,ial duties. 

Section 17. LMC I 6.04.120 and Section 220-S UBC Amended, LMC 16.04. I 20 ;md 
Section 220-S of the edition of the Uniform Building Code adopted by this Chapter are 
re-adopted as follows: 

STORY is that portion o f a B11ilding included between the upper surface of iuty 
noor and the upper surface or the floor next above, except I hat the topmost story 
shall be llmt portion of a Building included between the upper surface or the 
topmost noor and \he ceil ing or roof above. If lhc finished tloor level directly 
nbove a basement or 1mused undcr-noor space is more than 6 fce-t above grade as 
defined herein for more than 50 percent of the total t>erirnctcr or is more than 12 
Ice\ above grade as defined herein al any point, such basement or unused undcr-
0oor space shall be considered as a story. If any ponion of a basement is inte11dcd 
for humm1 habitation, or for assemblage of 1>coplc for any purpose, or parking, 
such basement shall be considered a story only for the purpose of dctennioing 
maximum nllowablc areas for the fire ~-prinkler requirements. 

Section 18. L1\1C 16.04.BO and SccHon 224-}Y IJBC Amendi:sl, LMC 16.04.1 30 :ind 
Section 224-W of the edition of the Unifonn Building Code adopted by this Chapter :ire 
re-adopted as follows: 

EXTERJOR \VALL is any wall or element of :i wall, or any member or group o f 
members. which de fines the ex terior boundaries or couns of a Building or which 
has a surface in contact with 1he exterior atmosphere and which has a slope of 60 
degrees or greater wilh horizontal plane. 

Section 19. LMC 16.04.J SO a nd Section 1804.7 UBC Amended, LMC 16.04.150 and 
Section 1804.7 of the edition of the Unifom1 Building Code adopted by this Chapter arc 
re-adopted as follows: 

(I) \ \later Drainage. When broughi 10 his attenLion that a water drainage problem 
or a potential water drainage problem exists on any lot or parcel of land, the 

l)'n\c:m1\9098nrd.00 I 8 



Building Official may require the owner or builder to correct such problem or 10 

submit plans showing the proposed method 10 correct such problem. The plan 
shall indicate in sufficient detail all pipes, ditches or other means of alleviating the 
waler drainage problem such that the water will nol damage any public or private 
property. If the Building Official docs 1101 approve the drainage plan. he then may 
require a drainage study to be conducted by a licensed prolessional engineer. The 
Building Official shall approve waler drainage plans or drainage studies in 
writing. No new construction may commence or continue in the area that may be 
affected by the potential water drainage problem. In all such occurrences, said 
corrective work slmll commence within thirty (30) days and be completed within 
sixty (60) days aficr receipt of this notice from the Building Official. For the 
purpose of administering this subsection, the Director of Public \Vorks is 
appointed and designated ,is the Building Official. 

Section 20. LMC 16.04.160 and Section 3303 UBC Amended. LMC 16.04. 160 and 
Section 3303 of the edition oflhe Unifi:mn Build ing Code adopted by this Chapter tu·c re
adopted as follows: 

Clcan111> of Public Streets 
3303.10. Public streets adjacent lo the properly upon which the bui lding permit is 
issued and other public streets which arc used for conveyance of materials 
incorporated into the cons1ruction work, including excavated earth, either to or 
from lhc site, shall be kept clean with a power broom or otber a1>proved means. 
Wheels of trucks including the space between dual treads shall be cleaned before 
entering Ci ty rigbts-of-way. The cleanup shall include the flushing of s101111 
sewers when required by the :Building Official. 

The Building Official may stop work of the building pennit for violations of this 
section. 

Seetion 21.LM~~ltffliell, LMC lG.04.179 1s repealed III its eBtirery-, 
[previously deleted by Ord. 2039) 

Section 22. I.MC 16.04. 180 Repeated. LMC 16.04.1 80 is repealed in its c111ircty. 

Secl'ion 23. LMC 16.04.190 Repcn(cd. LMC 16.04.190 is repealed in its entirety. 

Section 24. LMC 16.05.200 Repealed. LMC 16.04.200 is repealed in its entirety. 

Section 25. Scvcrnhility. If any section, subsection, pamgraph, sentence, clause, word or 
phrasD of this ordinance should be held invalid or unconstitutional by a court of 
competent jurisd iction, such invalidity or unconstitutionulily shall not affoct the va lidity 
or constitutionality of any other section. subsection , p11ragraph. sentence, clause, word or 
phr.isc of this ordinance. 

lynlord\'l091lord.001 9 



Section 26. Effective Dote. This Ordinance shall take e ffect and be in fall force January 
I, 1999. 

PASSED this ~ day of ~tnO/ 19.!f£ 1111d signed in authentication of its 
passagethis ~ dayof~ 1cyqf_: 

cs,L lid, 
TINA ROBERTS, Mayor 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

CTTY ArrORi\fEY 

lyu\urd\9098ortt001 10 




